
HBM Architects, LLC

CLARKSVILLE MONTGOMERY COUNTY PUBLIC LIBRARY

North Branch Library - Clarksville, TN

Furniture Package Proposal Tabulation Bid Date: 02/27/2025

Dealer

Lakeshore Learning

Patek Ho

800-421-5354 ext. 2802

pho@lakeshorelearning.com

LFi - Library Furniture 

International

Melissa Harlan

224-676-3416

melissa@libraryfurniture-

intl.com

ORI - Office Resources

Sara Clark

931-385-4449

sclark@oriusa.com

Alfred Williams & Co.

Danielle Watkins

615-244-0081

dwatkins@alfredwilliams.co

m

Office Images

Stacey Laurence

615-772-4424

slaurence@officeimagesinc.

com

Late Bid Not Considered Late Bid Not Considered

Item 1 - Andreu World No Bid No Bid $3,276.07

Item 2 - Anova No Bid No Bid $3,477.28

Item 3 - Arcadia No Bid No Bid $8,159.32

Item 4 - Artcobell by Floorwork No Bid No Bid $6,373.92

Item 4 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Artcobell
$3,035.80

Item 5 -Enwork No Bid No Bid $3,414.18

Item 5 -Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Enwork
$2,752.15

Item 6 - ERG International  No Bid $54,121.00 $42,371.79

Item 6 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for ERG (Partial L9a, OT7P, OT8P, OT9P)
$6,583.50

Item 7 - HABA by Gressco No Bid No Bid $1,767.05

Item 7 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Haba (Partial AP4, AP5)
$596.60

Item 8 - Haworth No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 8 - SitOnIt Substitution for Haworth $7,806.48

Item 9 - Heller No Bid No Bid $1,551.12

Item 9 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Heller
$720.10

Item 10 - High Tower No Bid No Bid $4,700.00

Item 10 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for High Tower
$1,512.40



Item 11 - Integra Seating No Bid No Bid $11,241.84

Item 12 - JSI No Bid No Bid $1,574.72

Item 12 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for JSI
$322.05

Item 13 - KI No Bid $114,425.00 $97,463.22

Item 13 - Steelcase Substitution for KI 

(Markerboard)
-$1,636.84

Item 13 - SitOnIt Seating Substitution for 

KI (Training Tables)
-$9,392.92

Item 13 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for KI (Partial B11, B12,C1a-c, C2, C4, C5a-

e, C6a-d, C7 (no carts), L2, L3, L4, L5, 

MB1, T9, T10, T11a-b, T12, T12P, T13)

$73,213.00

Item 14  - Kimball International No Bid No Bid $13,366.02

Item 14 - SOI Substitution for Kimball 

International
-$247.89

Item 14 -  Lakeshore Learning 

Substitution for Kimball International
$2,369.30

Item 15 - Landscape Forms No Bid No Bid $24,477.30

Item 16 - Leland International No Bid No Bid $282.21

Item 17 - Loll Designs No Bid No Bid $17,830.16

Item 17 -  Lakeshore Learning 

Substitution for Loll Designs (Partial O-T3)
$1,117.20

Item 18 - Media Technologies No Bid $33,963.00 $22,220.62

Item 18 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Media Technologies
$10,717.90

Item 19 - National Office No Bid No Bid $4,270.98

Item 19 - AMQ/Steelcase Substitution for 

National Office
-$1,135.65

Item 20 - OFS No Bid No Bid $943.18

Item 19 -Byrne Substitution for OFS

Item 21 - SitOnIt Seating No Bid No Bid $11,622.91

Item 22 - Smith Systems by Demco No Bid No Bid $13,153.31



Item 22 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Smith Systems
$9,030.70

Item 23 - Spec Furniture No Bid No Bid $13,153.31

Item 23 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for Spec Furniture
$5,160.40

Item 24 - Trinity No Bid No Bid $4,337.50

Item 25 - VS America No Bid No Bid $298.30

Item 25 - Lakeshore Learning Substitution 

for VS America
$189.98

Subtotal (Base Bid) $0.00 $202,509.00 $311,326.31

Truck/PM Fees $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Freight Included Included Included

Installation Included Included $31,062.00

Total Furniture Proposal (Base Bid) $0.00 $202,509.00 $342,388.31

Substitutions $117,321.08 $0.00 -$4,606.82

Total with Substitutions $117,321.08 $202,509.00 $337,781.49

Lowest Bid Proposal Including Accepted 

Substitutions (1 Dealer)
$350,194.79 $350,194.79

LEGEND

Lowest Proposal

Substitution Price


